
On October 30, 2023, the
Confederation of Bahadurgarh
Industries (COBI) organized an
interactive session with the
Haryana State Pollution Control
Board (HSPCB) for the
industrialists of the Jhajjar
district. The…
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We would like to present our newsletter highlighting the work done by COBI in
the month of October 2023. We are committed to working endlessly for the
welfare of industries and the industrial areas of the Jhajjar district and we look
forward to receiving your feedback and support for our future endeavors. Your
valuable time to review it is greatly appreciated.

Fostering Industry-Environment
Collaboration: COBI and HSPCB
Join Forces for a Cleaner Future
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The Entrepreneurs of the Jhajjar
district and the COBI Members
honored Sh. Parveen Garg- the
President of Confederation of
Bahadurgarh Industries (COBI)
has been chosen as a member of
the…

Read more...

Confederation of Bahadurgarh
Industries (COBI), in
collaboration with the District
MSME Center, Jhajjar, and
Federation of Indian Export
Organizations (FIEO), organized a
Capacity Building Programme
under the theme “District as…

COBI President Sh. Parveen Garg
Honored as Member of State Level
GST Grievance Redressal
Committee in Haryana

Empowering Jhajjar: COBI’s
“District as Export Hub” Capacity
Building Programme
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On October 20, 2023, there was
a free health check-up camp
organized by Indian Red Cross
Society, Jhajjar Branch at Parul
Rubber Products Private Limited
Bahadurgarh. They had Smt.…

Read more...

Cobi’s team was invited by
Jagannath University Kabalana,
Jhajjar as the chief guest on the
concluding day of the five-day
Youth Red Cross (YRC) training
camp being run in their…

Indian Red Cross Society’s Health
Check-up Camp Benefits Workers
at Parul Rubber Products Private
Limited, Bahadurgarh

Team COBI Honored as Chief
Guest at Jagannath University’s
Youth Red Cross Training Camp

COBI Delegation Advocates for
Road Improvement with Honorable
MP Sh. Hans Raj Hans Ji
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Representing COBI, COBI
President Mr. Praveen Garg, Vice
President Mr. Vipin Bajaj,
Advocate HKPS Lamba, Mr.
Sandeep Amolak Singh, Mr.
Mandeep Lamba, Mr. Surendra
Vashishtha, Mr. Purshottam
Goyal, Mr. Bimal…

Read more...

A very informative and productive
meeting held with the UHBVNL
Officials on 26.10.2023 at COBI
Office. The issues related to
power supply and other UHBVNL
related matter of the industrial…

COBI held a productive meeting
with officials from UHBVNL and
entrepreneurs to discuss ways to
improve power supply in the
industrial areas of Jhajjar

Meeting with Hon'ble Power
Minister of Haryana Ch. Ranjit
Singh Ji and other dignitaries to
address Industrial Electricity
Issues in jhajjar District
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On 18 October 2023, Honorable
Electricity Minister of Haryana
Chaudhary Ranjit Singh Ji,
Honorable MP Dr. Arvind Sharma
Ji, Honorable Deputy
Commissioner of Jhajjar District
Sir Captain Shakti Singh…

Read more...

We are delighted to share that
COBI successfully organized a
highly informative seminar on
“Aadhaar Seeding & ABHA
Generation” at our office on
(04.10.2023), in collaboration
with the ESIC. The…

In the dynamic landscape of the
business world, addressing
grievances is crucial for
maintaining a healthy and
productive work environment.
Business grievances can arise

COBI Seminar: Empowering
Entrepreneurs with Aadhaar
Seeding & ABHA Generation
Insights

Addressing Grievances in the
Business Environment: A Guide to
Effective Resolution
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from various sources, including
employees, customers,…
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In the ever-evolving landscape of
economic development, industry
associations stand as formidable
pillars of support, fostering
innovation, advocacy, and
collaboration. These organizations
play an indispensable role in
driving regional and…

Read more...

Local industries are the lifeblood
of regional economies, playing a
vital role in fostering economic
growth, job creation, and
community development. These
businesses, often characterized
by their local ownership and…

The Crucial Role of Industry
Associations in Economic
Development

The Economic Significance of Local
Industries: A Pillar of Regional
Prosperity
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Industrial development is a
multifaceted journey with its
share of challenges and
opportunities. This dynamic
sector serves as a cornerstone of
economic growth, fostering
innovation, job creation, and
infrastructure development.…

Challenges and Opportunities in
Industrial Development:
Navigating the Path to Progress
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